BID TABULATION FOR
CUSTODIAL/JANITORIAL SERVICES on
June 13, 2014, at 2:00 PM, Local
Time

Executive Kleen-Tech Sparkle United
Coverall of West Management Hadaway Facility| Hi-Tech Building Services SBM Janitorial TNT Building Commercial
Michigan CSM Services Services GDI Omni Maintenance Services Corporation Management Services Services, Inc. Services, Inc.

Item Bid
Year 1 Billing Period (28 Days) $14,104.00 $15,556.00 No Bid $13,059.00 No Bid $14,955.00 $13,251.50 No Bid $17,597.01 $15,750.00 $13,391.77
Year 1 Total Cost (13 Periods) $183,352.00 $202,228.00 No Bid $169,767.00 No Bid $194,415.00 $172,269.50 No Bid $228,761.13 $204,750.00 $174,093.01
Year 2 Billing Period (28 Days) $14,245.00 $15,556.00 No Bid $13,059.00 No Bid $14,955.00 $13,251.50 No Bid $17,597.01 $15,750.00 $13,391.77
Year 2 Total Cost (13 Periods) $185,185.00 $202,228.00 No Bid $169,767.00 No Bid $194,415.00 $172,269.50 No Bid $228,761.13 $204,750.00 $174,093.01
Year 3 Billing Period (28 Days) $14,388.00 $15,556.00 No Bid $13,059.00 No Bid $14,955.00 $13,251.50 No Bid $18,476.06 $14,950.00 $13,391.77
Year 3 Total Cost (13 Periods) $187,044.00 $202,228.00 No Bid $169,767.00 No Bid $194,415.00 $172,269.50 No Bid $240,188.78 $194,350.00 $174,093.01
Year 4 Billing Period (28 Days) $14,532.00 $15,556.00 No Bid $13,059.00 No Bid $14,955.00 $13,251.50 No Bid $19,399.87 $14,950.00 $13,391.77
Year 4 Total Cost (13 Periods) $188,916.00 $202,228.00 No Bid $169,767.00 No Bid $194,415.00 $172,269.50 No Bid $252,198.31 $194,350.00 $174,093.01
Four Year Grand Total $744,497.00 $808,912.00 No Bid $679,068.00 No Bid $777,660.00 $689,078.00 No Bid $949,909.35 $798,200.00 $696,372.04
Snow Removal Per Hour S 2250 (S 16.00 No Bid S 28.50 No Bid S 17.75 | S 23.50 No Bid No Bid S 40.00 | $ 18.50
Did Bidder Acknowledge Addendum
1? Yes Yes NA Yes NA Yes Yes NA Yes Yes Yes
Did Bidder Acknowledge Addendum
27 Yes Yes NA Yes NA Yes Yes NA No Yes Yes

CSM Services' Four Year Grand Total was announced as $808,920.00. A review of its calculations resulted in a Four Year Grand Total of 808,912.00.
Kleen-Tech Services' Four Year Grand Total was announced as $689,078.12. A review of its calculations resulted in a Four Year Grand Total of $689,078.00.
Sparkle Janitorial Services' Four Year Grand Total was announced as $876,845.00. A review of its calculations resulted in a Four Year Grand Total of $949,909.35.
United Commercial Services' Four Year Grand Total was announced as $696,372.00. A review of its calculation resulted in a Four Year Grand Total of $696,372.04.




