
Park Furniture Bid 

Tabulation Bid Closing, May 

30, 2014, 2:00 PM Local 

time

Bidders:
Jamestown 

Advanced 

Products Corp. Nexgen LLC 

RJ Thomas Mfg. 

Co. Inc. Miracle Midwest

Play 

Environments, Inc.

Best Litter 

Receptacles, Inc. Sinclair Recreation

Eagle One 

Products
Description of Item
12 Sets of Picnic Tables 3,108.00$              2,895.00$              1,352.40$              1,644.00$              1,800.00$              2,004.00$              2,081.64$              2,976.00$              
4 Sets of Picnic Table 

Frames, Universal 

Accessible 1,064.00$              No Bid 635.60$                 992.00$                 980.00$                 668.00$                 713.80$                 992.00$                 

1 Universal Accessible, 8' 

Picnic Table with Recycled 

Plastic Top/Seats No Bid No Bid 500.50$                 737.00$                 707.00$                 675.00$                 734.55$                 881.00$                 

6 Square Picnic Tables No Bid 4,020.00$              1,890.00$              2,624.00$              2,694.00$              5,700.00$              6,115.44$              11,760.60$            
4 Recycled Plastic Benches 

with Backrest No Bid No Bid 1,428.00$              1,928.00$              1,896.00$              1,660.00$              1,762.92$              2,412.00$              

4 Recycled Plastic Benches 

without Backrest No Bid No Bid 1,167.60$              1,576.00$              1,586.00$              1,008.00$              1,118.84$              1,300.00$              

Shipping & Handling 335.00$                 No Bid 979.00$                 975.00$                 1,289.00$              824.00$                 777.25$                 -$                        

TOTAL: 4,507.00$              6,915.00$              7,953.10$              10,476.00$            10,952.00$            12,539.00$            13,304.44$            20,321.60$            

All Items Bid? No No Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Addendum 1 

Acknowledged? No Yes Yes Yes Yes No Yes Yes
Addendum 2 

Acknowledged? No No Yes Yes No No No Yes


