
BID TABULATION

DENTAL CLINIC LABORATORY SERVICES

Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor

Item Dental Arts Lab

Space 

Maintainers of 

the Midwest

DSG Davis 

Dental 

Laboratory

Hatzakortzian 

Dental Lab

Space Maintainers, Unilateral band 

and loop, each
 $              65.00  $              41.95  $              39.50  $              55.00 

Space Maintainers, Lingual arch, 

each
 $              80.00  $              55.50  $              49.00  $              75.00 

Space Maintainers, Nance, each  No Bid  $              70.50  $              54.00  $              75.00 

Resin Lab Processed Crown, each  No Bid  No Bid  $              94.50  $              75.00 

Full Gold Crown, each  No Bid  No Bid  $            113.25  $            345.00 

PFM Crown, each  No Bid  No Bid  $            105.00  $            145.00 

Full Ceramic, each  No Bid  No Bid  $              90.00  $            185.00 

Occlusal Guards, each  $            100.00  $              81.95  $              89.00  $              75.00 

Denture Upper

Bite Rims, each  $              30.00  No Bid  $              29.50  $              45.00 

Set of teeth, each  $              40.00  No Bid  $              24.50  $              85.00 

Wax up, each  $              40.00  No Bid  $              79.00  $              35.00 

Processing and finishing, each  $              80.00  No Bid  $              56.00  $            105.00 

Denture Reline, each  $            120.00  No Bid  $              84.00  $              85.00 

Acknowledged Addendum #1?  Yes  No  No  Yes 
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